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DISSERTATION 

Dr. Ramesh Dr. K. Vijaya 

The morbidity pattern in Fishermen 
community at coastal Andhra 
Pradesh 

PG 
DISSERTATION 

Dr. Ramakrishna Dr. K. Vijaya 

Out of pocket expenditures among 
the drug resistant Tuberculosis 
patients registered under NTEP in 
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DISSERTATION 
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Socio-clinical profile of Pregnancy 
Induced Hypertension cases: An 
analysis in a district level maternity 
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DISSERTATION 

Dr. Upasana 
Dr. Radha Madhab 
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A cross-sectional study of 
reproductive tract infections in 
adolescent girls in field practice 
area of RHTC of a Tertiary care 
teaching hospital in Visakhapatnam 
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DISSERTATION 

Dr. Madhavi Dr. Ved P Kulkarni 

Male participation in maternal 
health care – A community based 
cross-sectional study 

PG 
DISSERTATION 
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Socio-clinical profile of teenage 
pregnant women attending the 
district maternity hospital 

PG 
DISSERTATION 

Dr. J Anusha 
Dr. Radha Madhab 
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of overweight and obesity among 
girl students at secondary schools 
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sectional study 
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DISSERTATION 

Dr. P Shanthi Dr. Ved P Kulkarni 

Health status and quality of life of 
post-menopausal women in rural 
field practice area 

PG 
DISSERTATION 

Dr. M. Moulika 
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Knowledge, Attitude, and Practices 
of e-waste among the Urban 
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SHORT PROJECT Dr. Upasana Dr. K. Vijaya 



 

 

Initiation of Breast Feeding among 
postnatal mothers admitted in a 
District Level Maternity Hospital: 
An Observational Study 

SHORT PROJECT Dr. Upasana 
Dr. Radha Madhab 
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Study of premenstrual syndrome 
and school attendance of 
adolescent girls of government 
secondary school in RHTC field 
practice area of NRIIMS 

SHORT PROJECT Dr. Madhavi Dr. Ved P Kulkarni 

Quality of Life in patients with TB-
HIV Co-Infection in Visakhapatnam, 
Andhra Pradesh 

SHORT PROJECT Dr. T N Manoj Dr. K. Vijaya 

Clinico-Epidemiological Profile of 
HIV-TB Coinfection Patients at 
Antiretroviral Centre, 
Visakhapatnam, Andhra Pradesh 

SHORT PROJECT Dr. T N Manoj Dr. K. Vijaya 

Knowledge, Attitude, and 
Awareness regarding HPV Infection 
and Vaccination Among Female IT 
Professionals of a coastal city – A 
Cross-Sectional Study 

SHORT PROJECT Dr. T N Manoj Dr. K. Vijaya 

Determinants and Practices of 
Contraceptive Use Among 
Postpartum Women in Rural 
Visakhapatnam – A Cross-Sectional 
Study 

SHORT PROJECT Dr. T N Manoj Dr. K. Vijaya 

 


